
    
Patna Branch Office, Patliputra Industrial Estate, Patna 800013 
e-mail   : pbo@bis.org.in & pbo.bis@nic.in

  
Phones : 2262808, Fax : 2275342 & 2262305, Gram : MANAKSANSTHA 

Invites 
EXPRESSION OF INTEREST

  

Bureau of Indian Standards (BIS) is an autonomous body functioning under the Ministry of 
Consumer Affairs, Food and Public Distribution, Govt. of India. Its primary functions, as given in the 
Bureau of Indian Standards Act, 1986 are standardization, Quality certification of products and 
services.  

BIS intends to outsource part of its Enforcement Activity to strengthen its drive against misuse of 
BIS Standard Mark (       Mark) for which it requires services of specialized agencies. Bids are 
invited for the entire State of Bihar and/or Jharkhand.  

Sealed Expression of Interest are invited from interested agencies location wise in TWO BID 
system, i.e Technical Bid and Price Bid separately. Both Technical and Price Bids may be 
submitted in separate envelopes duly sealed and both the envelopes may be put in the third 
envelope which may also be sealed and submitted to the Director & Head, Bureau of Indian 
Standards, Patliputra Industrial Estate, Patna, latest by 29th August 2008.   

Clear indication may be given on the Envelopes about Technical Bid and Price Bid. Only Technical 
Bid shall be opened in the presence of such interested parties or their duly authorized 
Representatives as may like to be present at 1530 h on the same day in the chamber of Director & 
Head, Patna Branch Office (Phone No. 2262808). The date and time of opening of Price bid, in 
case of agencies found eligible, shall be intimated separately.  

Envelope of Technical Bid should contain complete information in the specified format.  

In the envelope of Price Bid only rate for carrying out the assigned work per case to be paid may 
be mentioned.  

The details of terms and condition and format for applying for technical bid can be obtained from 
the website of BIS: http://www.bis.org.in or can be had from Director & Head, Bureau of Indian 
Standards, Patna Branch Office (Phone No. 2262808) on any working day between 10 00 to     
17 00 h.  

A briefing session on the scope of the work under E.O.I. will be held on 26 August 2008 at 1530 h 
in the Cabin of Director & Head, Bureau of Indian Standards (Patna Branch Office), for the 
agencies interested to file the bid. 

Director & Head (Patna Branch Office) 

http://www.bis.org.in
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